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Community 
Development Permit Withdrawal & Refund Request 

(Only the Property Owner or Contractor of Record may request a permit to be withdrawn) 
This form must be submitted in person or via email to: econnect@leegov.com 

Permit/Case #: RES2023-00401 Address: 17653 CAPTIVAISLAND LN. 
FORT MYERS1 FL 33908 

CONTRACTOR INFORMATION OWNER(Sl INFORMATION 
Company & Contractor Name: Property Owner(s) Name: 
ELIAS BROTHERS GROUP 
1'f ORIAH P. ELIAS 
License #: CGC059267 PO POLI JAYE L 

Address: 4627 ARNOLD A VE. STE. 201 Address: 17653 Captiva Island Ln. 
City, State & Zip: NAPLES, FL 34104 City, State & Zip: Ft. Myers, FL 33908 
Phone: 239-643-1624 Phone: 

Email: permittin2@elias-brothers.com Email: 

Reason for Withdrawal (select one of the following): 

I!] No work was done: (verification by Code Enforcement may be required) 
D Applied for the wrong: D Permit type D Jurisdiction D Address/Strap Number 
[] Work was completed under Permit/Case#: ________________ _ 
[] Duplicate Permit Applied for 
[] Other (please explain): Homeowener will be pulling his/her own permit. Doing extra 
work that we weren't hire for. 

REFUND POLICY: (ALLOW 4-6 WEEKS TO PROCESS) 

• No refund on permits of $50 or less, unless issued in error by the County 
• No refund on any permit shall be granted if work has commenced 
• Refund on_all other permits shall be at 75% of the permit fee 
• There shall be no refund on any plan review, zoning review, admin, radon, completion, 

extension, or revision fee 
• Impact Fee refunds are subject to the provisions of Chapter 2 of the LDC 

[!] I am also requesting a refund on Permit/Case#: _RE_ S_2_0_2_3_-0_0_4_0_1 ______ _ 

Reason for refund: HOMEOWNER DECIDED TO PULL HIS OWN PERMIT. 

MoRIAHP.ELIAS ~£,A.W 0411112023 
Printed Name Signat Authorization* Date 
*Requests submitted by a contractor must be signed by the license holder or authorized signer on file with Lee County. 

Web/PennitWithdrawal&RefundRequest (4/2021) 
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Renee Sloan 

Froip: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 
Att~chments: 

Good morning, 

Ada Mejia 
Tuesday, April 11, 2023 10:02 AM 
econnect@leegov.com 
Robyn Alice; Renee Sloan; Joe DiRienzi Sr. 
Requesting Withdrawal & Refund for-17653 Captiva Island Ln. RES2023-00401 
PermitWithdrawalRefundRequest.pdf 

Attached is the withdrawal form and refund for the above address and permit number. Please contact me if 
you have any questions. 

Thanks, 

«r~ 
46127 Arnold Ave, Suite 201 
Naples, FL 34104 

Di~ect : 239-610-3211 
Office: 239-643-1624 ext. 2025 
adal.mejia@elias-brothers.com 
wviw.eliasbrothersgroup.com 

(11 ELIAS BROTHERS GROUP~ 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended 
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or 
distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all 
copi~s of the original message. 
Per Florida Senate Bill 76 - Consumer is responsible for payment of any insurance deductible; It is insurance fraud 

I 

punishable as a felony of the third degree for a contractor to knowingly or willfully, and with intent to injure, defraud, or 
decJive, pay, waive, or rebate all or part of an insurance deductible application to payment to the contractor for repairs 
to a property covered by a property insurance policy; and It is insurance fraud punishable as a felony of the third degree 
to intentionally file an insurance claim containing false, incomplete, or misleading information 

1 
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4/7/2023 2:02 PM FROM: Offic~ Depot "21 

Mail body: F\\d: 17653 Captiva Island Lane Fort Myers, FL 

---------- Forwarded m:ssage ---------
From Jaye Popoli <;p\1J,-1"-'_ii.!_:_+L:L~iu_1._1.iL1,.11;_r> 
Date: Thu. Apr 6, 2023, 8:52 AM 
Subject: 17653 Captiva Island Lare Fort Myers. FL 
To: Jaye Popoli <it:t!f~\1i;J.;+LrJ:i!.WL,:;_•uv 

Dear Joe. 

P. 1 / 1 

As you kmw I have hired a rew contractor fur the c.on:pletion of~ ootre. Thcre are a couple issues that I need to address with you 

You delivcred insulatim and drywaD that are in my g;:irnge, if you would like m: to rcirrburse you fur the rmterial please send ire a copy of the 
original invoice, 

The plurming in the ootre. I have your contract and have ag;iin spoken v..ith Fr.'MA. They still have a few unarnwered ql.1Cl,1iom. If you would h"k.e 
to coliact them to get thcse funds approved thc poore nunbcr i~ 1800 621 3362, my registration # is 614327644. If you do oot my new 
contractor and his subcontractors he ha.~ been working with will take over, thcy have oo problem. working will FF.MA and getting approtal of all 
funding their projects have needed. 

\lllden.1and that I am not finaocially or cornactually oblig;:ited to pay fur any plurming work l did oot authori~. Please let rrc kmw at your earliest 
convenience how you would like to proceed in these two netters. 

Thank you. 
Jaye Popoli 
239 878 2205 
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