
Elias Brothers General Contractor, Inc. 
4627 Arnold Avenue, Suite 201 
Naples, FL 34104 US 
(239) 293-2442 
doreen@ebgcontracting.com 

INVOICE 
BILL TO 
James Cillo 
5 Cochran Hill Road 
Poughkeepse, NY 12603 

DESCRIPTION 

SHIP TO 
James Cillo 
17601 Captiva Lane 

QTY RATE 

Change Order 1 - Upgrade 0.50 13,980.00 
kitchen countertop, invoice 
50% 

Change Order 2 - Remove 0.50 7,267.00 
& dispose upper cabinets & A 

ELlAs BROTHERS GROUP 
ROOFING DIVISION 

INVOICE# 32021 
DATE 03/29/2023 

DUE DATE 03/29/2023 
TERMS Due on receipt 

AMOUNT 

6,990.00 

3,633.50 

="" with new. invoice ~ V 
·····•································ ·························~ ·~ ·-······ ················· ··· ························· 
PAYMENT BY CHECK ONLY - WE WI~% PAYMENT 10,623.50 
NEVER ASK YOU FOR A ACH OR WIRE BALANCE DUE 
TRANSFER. 
Our terms are due upon Invoicing. Service 
charges will be calculated at 1 .5% or highest 
rate permitted by law and incorporated to all 
past due invoices. In the event that our firm 
should undertake any legal process to enforce 
any payment on our A9reement, 2nd Party 
agrees to pay, in addition to any costs or 
damages a reasonable Attorney's Fee. 
Checks must be in U.S. Funds and drawn on a 
U.S. Bank. If check is written from a Foreign 
Bank, add $35.00 for US Bank processing fees 
or pay by an American Express Money Order. 
Please make check payable to Elias Brothers 
General Contracting, Inc., 4627 Arnold Ave., 
Suite 201, Naples, FL 34104 

Thank you for your business! 

$0.00 

ELIAS - #01069



Renee Sloan 

From: 
Sent: 

Doreen Zeneski <doreen@ebgcontracting.com> 
Thursday, March 30, 2023 9:06 AM 

To: Renee Sloan 
Subject: James Cillo 
Attachments: I nvoice_32021.pdf 

Hi Renee, 

Attached is James Cilia's paid invoice. I charged $5,000 yesterday to his credit card and the balance $5,623.50 today. 

Doreen Zeneski 
Accounting Manager 
Elias Brothers General Contractor, Inc. 
ROOFING DIVISION 
4627 Arnold Avenue, Unit #201 
Naples, FL 34104 
239-293-2442 
www.Eliasbrothersgroup.com 

. EuAs BR~ GROUP -- -- --·--
ROOFING DIVISION 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended 
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution 
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the 
original message. 

Per Florida Senate Bill 76 - Consumer is responsible for payment of any insurance deductible; It is insurance fraud punishable as a 
felony of the third degree for a contractor to knowingly or willfully, and with intent to injure, defraud, or deceive, pay, waive, or 
rebate all or part of an insurance deductible application to payment to the contractor for repairs to a property covered by a property 
insurance policy; and It is insurance fraud punishable as a felony of the third degree to intentionally file an insurance claim 
containing false, incomplete, or misleading information. 

1 ELIAS - #01070



Elias Brothers General Contractor, Inc. 
4627 Arnold Avenue, Suite 201 
Naples, FL 34104 US 
(239) 293-2442 
doreen@ebgcontracting.com 

INVOICE 
BILL TO 

James Cillo 
5 Cochran Hill Road 
Poughkeepse, NY 12603 

DESCRIPTION 

SHIP TO 

James Cillo 
17601 Captiva Lane 

QlY RATE 

Change Order 1 - Upgrade 0.50 13,980.00 
kitchen countertop, invoice 
50% 

Change Order 2- Remove 0.50 7,267.00 
& dispose upper cabinets & ~ 
replace with new. invoice ~ ~ 

50% ~ 

t~i~~ii~i8tiiii iNki~ i~ W1~~ ~ =jDUE 
TRANSFER. 
Our terms are due upon Invoicing. Service 
charges will be calculated at 1 .5% or highest 
rate permitted by law and incorporated to all 
past due invoices. In the event that our firm 
should undertake any legal process to enforce 
any payment on our Apreement, 2nd Party 
agrees to pay, in addition to any costs or 
damages a reasonable Attorney's Fee. 
Checks must be in U.S. Funds and drawn on a 
U.S. Bank. If check is written from a Foreign 
Bank, add $35.00 for US Bank processing fees 
or pay by an American Express Money Order. 
Please make check payable to Elias Brothers 
General Contracting, Inc., 4627 Arnold Ave., 
Suite 201, Naples, FL 34104 

Thank you for your business I 

ELIAS BROTHERS GROUP 
ROOFING DIVISION 

INVOICE# 32021 
DATE 03/29/2023 

DUE DATE 03/29/2023 
TERMS Due on receipt 

AMOUNT 

6,990.00 

3,633.50 

10,623.50 

$0.00 

ELIAS - #01071



Date: January 6, 2023 

RE: Flooring Material Verification 
FOR: James Cillo -17601 Captiva Island Lane 
REF: Island Park 5.2 
REP: Joe DiRienzi Sr. - Restoration Project Manager/Estimator 

FLOORING MATERIAL VERIFICATION 

Dear Mr. Cillo, 

Please see the below material selection for your home at 17601 Captiva Island Lane. Please verify 
and approve the materials below to confirm your order. 

MATERIAL SELECTED: 

• 7003006500- Mocha Wide T&G Bamboo - Plank flooring- (1,817.60 SF) 

Respectfully, 

r~ Dill-~ s v. 
ElJ)EUASBROTHERSGROUP 
Joe DiRienzi Sr. Restoration Division Projects 
Ma nag er /Estimator 

ACCEPTANCE 

By signing below, I approve and confirm the flooring selection as indicated above. 

Signature. ____________________ Date ______ _ 

Please Print Name:'-----------------

3570 Enterprise Avenu P, Suite 100 • N aples, FL 34104 • Phone 239-643-1624. • Toll Fre>e 800-803-6415 • Fax 239-643-4918 

www .elias-brothers.com 
CGC059267 

--- __ J 

https:/felinsbrotht.'TS?>roup-m) >h~ ,.p•Ai,t t.:,r!,,p.c ·t:i..,:1~~,,r . .::<. ~le-~!t_E:lias-brothers_com/Documents/Desl,..:top,Jamet. Cillo Floor Selection VerifiQtion comfirmation 1.6.23 d;n--~ ELIAS - #01072



Date: January 6, 2023 

RE: Flooring Material Verification 
FOR: James Cillo -17601 Captiva Island lane 
REF: Island Park 5.2 
REP: Joe OIRlenzl Sr.• Restoration Project Manager/Estimator 

FLOORING MATERIAL VEAIFICATION 

Dear Mr. Cillo, 

Please see the below material selection for your home at 17601 Captiva Island Lane. Please verify 
and approve the materials below to confirm your order. 

MATERIAL SELECTED: 

• 7003006500-MRl!ii Wide T&G Bamboo - Plank flooring-(1,817.60 SF) 

A-,-,t,<t ... ~ -:SAv4 

Respectfully, 

Toe/D(3<.~Sr. 
!Q;) ELIASBROTHERSGROUP-
Joe DiRienzi Sr. Restoration Division Projects 
Manager/Estimator 

ACCEPTANCE 

By signing below, I approve and confirm the flooring selection as indicated above. 

Signature_~_-:::-.._~..:.:?~/~----_-_....:..J~+f__:(=J=~=------=·==·:_,,::::.-...:i.·1., _____ 1Date I It& 1~ 7> 

\) t -'°1 "1"""" "'1 /? flo ,7 ... _01 rLAD'·,·J• -:i:.-;;.t .. . .J (,.._,c.: Please Print Name, _.) ,..,. '- ~ ' · L,' "'· - ~ ' ~ 

3570 Enterprise Avt-nue, Suite 100 • Naples, FL 3410! • Phone239-643-1624 • Toll l'ree 800-803-MlS • Fax 2.19-643-4918 
www.elias-brothert,.som 

CGC059267 

--. -----.-. ---------- ----.-.- ----~- ELIAS - #01073
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